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Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel for Baltimore - Net Price Differential 

per Gallon
0.3500$          (0.0470)$         (0.0481)$         (0.0011)$    (0.0171)$         No Bid No Bid (0.0301)$       

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel for Fairfax - Net Price Differential per 

Gallon
0.3500$          (0.0638)$         (0.0631)$         0.0125$      No Bid No Bid No Bid (0.0301)$       

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0755  $        (0.0046)  $         0.0008  $     0.0190  $        (0.0039)  $         0.2750  No Bid 0.0181$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0755  $        (0.0046)  $         0.0008  $     0.0300  $         0.0007  No Bid  No Bid 0.0200$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0092  $         0.0123  $     0.0400  $         0.0111 0.0401$          No Bid 0.0300$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0067$           $         0.0123  $     0.0400 0.0107$           No Bid  No Bid 0.0350$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1043$           $         0.0024  $     0.0190 0.0578$          0.0305$          No Bid 0.0200$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1043  $         0.0024  $     0.0190  No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0399$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0337$           $         1.3095  $     0.0300 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.0399$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0337$           $         1.3095  $     0.0300 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.0399$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.9550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0499  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.0500$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.9550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0499  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.0699$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0600 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.0799$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0600 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.0799$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.9550  $        (0.0054)  $        (0.0038)  $     0.0400  $        (0.0006)  No Bid  $       0.0200 0.0300$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $        (0.0129)  $        (0.0038)  $     0.0600  $        (0.0107)  No Bid  $       0.0200 0.0250$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0115  $         0.0076  $     0.0700  $         0.0094 No Bid 0.0300$       0.0400$         

IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UP

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 1 - METROPOLITAN VIRGINIA                                                   

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 2 - MONTGOMERY COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPWinter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0115$           $         0.0026  $     0.0800 0.0018$           No Bid  $       0.1087 0.0400$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1135$           $         0.0478  $     0.0700 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1285  $         0.0478  $     0.0800  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0497$           $         1.3095  $     0.0500 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0497$           $         1.3095  $     0.0500 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0007  $         0.0261  $     0.0175  $         0.0016  $         0.0010  $       0.0416 0.0150$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0132  $         0.0261  $     0.0300  $         0.0238  No Bid  $       0.0416 0.0500$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0111  $         0.0376  $     0.0399  $         0.0116 0.0135$          0.0516$       0.0500$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0311$           $         0.0376  $     0.0399 0.0313$           No Bid  $       0.0516 0.0500$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1146$           $         0.0278  $     0.0400 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.0500$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1146  $         0.0278  $     0.0400  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0346$           $         1.3095  $     0.0350 0.0639$           No Bid  $       0.9205 0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0346$           $         1.3095  $     0.0350 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.9205 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.9550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.9206 0.2000$         

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 3 - PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPBiodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.9550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.9950$          No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0700 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
0.9950$          No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0700 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $        (0.0168)  $        (0.0166)  $     0.0300  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0267 0.0200$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $        (0.0168)  $        (0.0166)  $     0.0350  $        (0.0016)  No Bid  $       0.0267 0.0150$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0058  $        (0.0001)  $     0.0370  No Bid No Bid 0.0367$       0.0300$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0057$           $        (0.0001)  $     0.0370 0.0034$           No Bid  $       0.0367 0.0350$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1146$           $        (0.0099)  $     0.0299 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.0300$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1146  $        (0.0099)  $     0.0299  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0297$           $         1.3095  $     0.0300 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0297$           $         1.3095  $     0.0300 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $        (0.0059)  $        (0.0057)  $     0.0200  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0103 0.0225$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $        (0.0059)  $        (0.0057)  $     0.0200  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0103 0.0235$         

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 4 - WASHINGTON, DC

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 5 - ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPWinter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0040  $         0.0057  $     0.0250  No Bid No Bid 0.0203$       0.0275$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0040$           $         0.0057  $     0.0250 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0203 0.0289$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1373$           $         0.0009  $     0.0249 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.0250$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1373  $         0.0009  $     0.0249  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          (0.0010)$          $         1.3095  $     0.0200 0.0467$           $         0.0069  $       0.0443 OPIS

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          (0.0010)$          $         1.3095  $     0.0200 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0443 0.0074$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0042  $         0.1750  $     0.0400  $         0.0202  $         0.0046  $       0.0299 0.0100$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0092  $         0.1750  $     0.0450  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0299 0.0100$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0153  $         0.1864  $     0.0550  $         0.0252 0.0171$          0.0399$       0.0200$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0178$           $         0.1864  $     0.0550 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0399 0.0300$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1106$           $         0.1766  $     0.0400 No Bid No Bid 1.0400$       0.2000$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1106  $         0.1766  $     0.0400  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0288$           $         1.3095  $     0.0380 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0300$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0288$           $         1.3095  $     0.0400 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0399$         

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 6 - CARROLL  COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPBiodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0499$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0499$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0700$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0799$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $        (0.0042)  $         0.0353  $     0.0450  $         0.0089  $        (0.0094)  $       0.0168 OPIS

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0066  $         0.0353  $     0.0450  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0168 0.0075$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0020  $         0.0467  $     0.0500  $         0.0139 0.0031$          0.0283$       0.0150$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0143$           $         0.0467  $     0.0500 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0283 0.0175$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1405$           $         0.0369  $     0.0450 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       0.2000$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1605  $         0.0369  $     0.0450  No Bid No Bid 1.0400$       0.2000$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0403$           $         1.3095  $     0.0450 0.0476$           No Bid  $       0.0463 0.1999$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0955$          0.0403$           $         1.3095  $     0.0450 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0463 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0450  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0450  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0177  $         0.0184  $     0.0400  $         0.0337  $         0.0253  $       0.0513 0.0350$         

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 8 - FREDERICK COUNTY, MARYLAND

SECTION 2: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 7 - HOWARD  COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPUltra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC 

DELIVERY Zone 8 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0177  $         0.0184  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0513 0.0350$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport WILL 

CALL Zone 8 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.0310  $         0.0298  $     0.0500  $         0.0387 0.0378$          0.0613$       0.0450$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Truck Transport 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - Net Price Differential per 
0.0955$          0.0340$           $         0.0298  $     0.0500 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.0613 0.0450$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.0955$          0.1666$           $         0.0250  $     0.0400 0.0501$          No Bid 0.0537$       0.0399$         

Dyed Diesel Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  $         0.1666  $         0.0250  $     0.0400  No Bid No Bid 0.0537$       0.0399$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
1.0550$          0.0375$           $         1.3095  $     0.0400 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0399$         

Heating Oil Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
1.0550$          0.0375$           $         1.3095  $     0.0400 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.0399$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0400  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Truck Transport AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.0955  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.0800  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 0.2000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.2769  $     0.2000  $         0.2196  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.2769  $     0.2000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3134  $     0.2200  $         0.2246 No Bid No Bid 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3134  $     0.2200  No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         0.2786  $     0.2500 0.5394$          No Bid No Bid 1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1- Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.2786  $     0.2500  No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
3.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.2500 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 1 - METROPOLITAN VIRGINIA
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPHeating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
3.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.2500 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 1 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 1 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.3095  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4590  $     0.3500  $         0.3047  No Bid  $       0.3021 0.7500$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4590  $     0.3500  $         0.3574  No Bid  $       0.3125 0.7500$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4590  $     0.3700  $         0.3097 No Bid 0.3091$       1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4590  $     0.3700  $         0.3624 No Bid 0.3226$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         0.4590  $     0.3500 No Bid No Bid 0.4897$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4590  $     0.3500  No Bid No Bid 0.4897$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
3.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid  $       0.3635 1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
3.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  $         0.3464  No Bid  $       0.4727 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.4727 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 2 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  $         0.3092  No Bid  $       0.3465 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 2 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.3465 1.0000$         

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 2 - MONTGOMERY COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UP

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3262  $     0.2500  $         0.2644  No Bid  $       0.2693 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3262  $     0.2600  $         0.2639  No Bid  $       0.2693 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3365  $     0.2500  $         0.2694 No Bid 0.2793$       1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3365  $     0.2500  $         0.2689 No Bid 0.2793$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         0.3279  $     0.2700 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3279  $     0.2700  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.2700 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.2700 No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.2700  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.2700  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 3 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 3 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.4017  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.4017  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.4120  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.4120  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         1.4034  $     0.3500 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 3 - PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 4 - WASHINGTON, DC



 Atlantic 

Petroleum & 

Mineral 

Resources 

 Campbell Oil 

Company 

 Global 

Montello 

Group Corp. 

 James 

River 

Solutions 

 Mansfield Oil 

Company of 

Gainesville, 

Inc. 

 Petroleum 

Traders 

Corporation 

 Pinnacle 

Petroleum, 

Inc. 

 Sunoco, LLC 

IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPDyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         2.7500  No Bid  $         1.4034  $     0.3500  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.7500 No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 4 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 4 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.1367  $     0.1750  $         0.1598  No Bid  $       0.1289 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.1367  $     0.2500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.1289 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.1470  $     0.2000  $         0.1648  No Bid  $       0.1389 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.1470  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.1389 1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         0.1634  $     0.2200 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.1634  $     0.3500  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 0.5160$           No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 0.5877$           No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 5 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.6945  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 5 - ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPBiodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 5 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.6945  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.0017  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.0017  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.0120  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.0120  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       1.0500 1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         1.0034  $     0.3500 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.0034  $     0.3500  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 6 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 6 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3262  $     0.3500  $         0.3102  No Bid  $       0.3098 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3262  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.3098 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3365  $     0.3500  $         0.2902  No Bid  $       0.3077 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3365  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.3078 1.0000$         

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 6 - CARROLL COUNTY, MARYLAND

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 7 - HOWARD COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPDyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         0.3279  $     0.3500 No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.3279  $     0.3500  No Bid No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 0.5175$           No Bid 0.3654$       0.7000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid 0.3654$       0.7500$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 7 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 7 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.5040  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4767  $     0.3500  $         1.1320  No Bid  $       0.3967 1.0000$         

Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY 

Zone 8 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4767  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.3967 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL 

Zone 8 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4870  $     0.3500  $         1.1370  No Bid  $       0.4067 1.0000$         

Winter Blend Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Tank Wagon 

AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - Net Price Differential per 
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4870  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid  $       0.4067 1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
0.3550$          No Bid  $         0.4784  $     0.3500 1.1370$          No Bid 0.4235$       1.0000$         

Dyed Diesel Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         0.4784  $     0.3500  No Bid No Bid 0.4235$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 1.1946$           No Bid 0.4638$       1.0000$         

Heating Oil Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - Net 

Price Differential per Gallon
2.7500$          No Bid  No Bid  $     0.3500 No Bid  No Bid 0.4638$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3550  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3500  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B5 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3250  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

SECTION 3: ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL, DYED DIESEL, HEATING OIL, AND BIODIESEL - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 8 - FREDERICK COUNTY, MARYLAND
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IFB #1162628

Purchase of Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel, Dyed Diesel, Heating Oil, and Biodiesel (Reverse Auction)
Montgomery County, MD 

Final Net Price Differentials ‐ February 22, 2024

SECTION 1 - ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL - F.O.B. TERMINAL POINT PICK UPBiodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon WILL CALL Zone 8 - Net Price 

Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3250  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         

Biodiesel - B20 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY Zone 8 - 

Net Price Differential per Gallon
 $         0.3250  No Bid  $         1.5345  $     0.3000  No Bid  No Bid 1.0500$       1.0000$         


