Montgomery County, MD
IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)
Final Net Price Differentials
Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River Qil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Qil Companies
SECTION ONE - TERMINAL POINT PICKUP
Regular Unleaded BALTIMORE - Net Price Differential
Gzlglzjr nieade et rrice DITerential bert — «» 9997 $0.0054 | ($0.0100) | ($0.0200) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0203)
Mid Grade Unleaded BALTIMORE - Net Price Differential
'd brade Ynieade etrrice DIerential | - ¢3 9100 ($0.0006) | $0.0800 | ($0.0311) | No Bid No Bid NoBid | ($0.0337)
per Gallon
Premium Unleaded BALTIMORE - Net Price Differential
remiim Ynieade et Frice iterentia $3.0200 ($0.0481) | $0.0400 | ($0.0666) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0626)
per Gallon
Regular Unleaded FAIRFAX - Net Price Differential
GZﬁLCJ):r nieade et Frice Diiterential per $0.0800 $0.0208 | ($0.0050) | ($0.0105) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0103)
Mid Grade Unleaded FAIRFAX - Net Price Differential
Ga:llonra € Yhieade et rrice DITerentialper | ¢4 9787 $0.0185 | $0.0800 | ($0.0205) | No Bid No Bid NoBid | ($0.0204)
Premium Unleaded FAIRFAX - Net Price Differential
G;‘Tlrz:]“m nieade et rrice DITErentialper | ¢4 9787 $0.0350 | $0.0800 | ($0.0222) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0074)
SECTION TWO - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 1 - METROPOLITAN VIRGINIA
Regular Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 1 - _
eguiar nieaded Truck franspor $0.0687 $0.0215 | ($0.0100) | ($0.0099) | $0.0189 | ($0.0119) No Bid ($0.0112)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
eguiar Unieaded fruck transport AV $1.0200 $0.0208 | ($0.0090) | ($0.0091) | No Bid No Bid NoBid | ($0.0088)
DELIVERY, ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 1| _
16 rade Lhieaded Truck franspor $0.1200 $0.0189 | ($0.0095) | ($0.0150) | $0.0199 | ($0.0130) No Bid ($0.0109)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
16 brade Unieaded fruck fransport A $1.0400 $0.0196 | ($0.0095) | ($0.0110) | No Bid No Bid NoBid | ($0.0109)
DELIVERY, ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 1 - .
remiim nieaded Iruck transpor $0.1200 ($0.0014) | $0.0010 | ($0.0400) | $0.0199 | ($0.0392) No Bid ($0.0348)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
remidm Unieaded Truck transpor $1.0600 ($0.0016) | $0.0010 | ($0.0400) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0302)

DELIVERY, ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
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Montgomery County, MD

IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)
Final Net Price Differentials
Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River Oil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Oil Companies
E85 Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 1 - Net Pri
> Jruciciranspor etrrice No Bid $0.0849 NoBid | $1.5000 | NoBid | $0.0600 No Bid $0.0404
Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 1 Net
> Jruciciranspor 1 NoBid $0.0416 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0404
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION TWO - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 2 - MONTGOMERY COUNTY, MARYLAND
Regular Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 2 - ,
eguiar nieaded Truck franspor $1.0700 $0.0277 | (0.0100) | (0.0101) | $0.0128 | ($0.0083) No Bid ($0.0099)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
estliar Un'eadec Truck Transport ALY $1.0800 $0.0268 | ($0.0100) | ($0.0101) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0099)
DELIVERY, ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 2
G Srade Snieaced TTUck ITanspor $1.0900 $0.0243 | ($0.0090) | ($0.0150) | $0.0128 | ($0.0062) No Bid ($0.0104)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
¢ brade Ln'eaded TrLck Transport A $1.1000 $0.0255 | ($0.0090) | ($0.0150) | No Bid No Bid NoBid | ($0.0104)
DELIVERY, ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 2 -
FEmtim ieacse IUCK TTenspor $1.1100 $0.0029 | $0.0010 | ($0.0075) | NoBid | ($0.0300) No Bid ($0.0122)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
remitim Lieaded TLck Transport AY $1.1200 $0.0034 | $0.0010 | ($0.0075) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0122)
DELIVERY, ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 2 - Net Pri
> Jruciciranspor etrrice No Bid $0.0774 NoBid | $1.4999 | NoBid | $0.0600 No Bid $0.0336
Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 2 Net
> Jruciciranspor 1 NoBid $0.0783 NoBid | $1.4998 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0336
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION TWO - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 3 - PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
Regular Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 3 - ,
eguiar nieaded Truck franspor $1.1300 $0.0273 | $0.0060 | ($0.0085) | $0.0163 | ($0.0063) No Bid ($0.0070)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
egullar Unieaded fruck transport AT $1.1400 $0.0276 | $0.0060 | ($0.0085) | No Bid No Bid NoBid | ($0.0070)
DELIVERY, ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
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IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)

Montgomery County, MD

Final Net Price Differentials

Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River oil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Oil Companies
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 3
¢ arade Lnieaded Truck Transpor $1.1500 $0.0226 | $0.0049 | $0.0018 | NoBid | (%0.0033) No Bid ($0.0031)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
10 brade Unieadea Truck fransport A $1.1600 $0.0219 | $0.0049 | $0.0018 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0000
DELIVERY, ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 3 -
hibsliheintanatiebishad $1.1700 ($0.0254) | $0.0010 | $0.0043 | NoBid | ($0.0300) No Bid ($0.0256)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
refitim Leaced TTLCK TTansport - $1.1800 ($0.0254) | $0.0010 | $0.0043 | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0236)
DELIVERY, ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 3 - Net Pri . . . .
> ruck transpor etrrice No Bid $0.0748 NoBid | $1.4999 | NoBid | $0.0600 No Bid $0.0318
Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 3 Net . . . . .
o jruettranspor 1 NoBid $0.0736 NoBid | $1.4998 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0318
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION TWO - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 4 - WASHINGTON, DC
R lar Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 4 -
estiar n'eaded TUck Transpor $1.0587 $0.0241 | $0.0800 | ($0.0070) | $0.0376 | (%0.0097) No Bid ($0.0052)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
R lar Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
estliar Yn'eaded Truck Transport ALY $1.2000 $0.0236 | $0.0800 | ($0.0055) | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0052)
DELIVERY, ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 4
G Brade Sieaced TTLCR ITanspor $1.2100 $0.0214 | $0.0800 | $0.0040 | NoBid | $0.0000 No Bid $0.0025
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
'd farade Ln'eadied Truck Transport A $1.2200 $0.0211 | $0.0800 | $0.0049 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0035
DELIVERY, ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 4 -
bkl tanaitiaibisksad $1.2300 ($0.0006) | $0.0800 | $0.0050 | NoBid | ($0.0300) No Bid ($0.0102)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
remitim Lieaced TTLCK TTanspart ¢ $1.2400 $0.0002 | $0.0800 | $0.0050 | No Bid No Bid No Bid ($0.0102)
DELIVERY, ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 4 - Net Pri
ruckctranspor etrrice No Bid $0.0732 NoBid | $1.5000 | NoBid | $0.0600 No Bid $0.0316

Differential per Gallon
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Montgomery County, MD

IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)

Final Net Price Differentials

Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River Qil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Oil Companies
E85 Truck T t AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 4 Net
sl 1 NoBid $0.0733 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0316
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION TWO - TRUCK TRANSPORT DELIVERY - ZONE 5 - ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY, MARYLAND
Regular Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 5 -
egtiar nieaded Truck franspor $0.0587 $0.0225 | $0.0800 | ($0.0061) | $0.0131 | ($0.0024) $0.0407 | ($0.0052)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
egtliar Unieaded Truck transport ALY $1.2600 $0.0241 | $0.0800 | ($0.0061) | No Bid No Bid $0.0407 | ($0.0052)
DELIVERY, ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 5|
¢ arade Lnieaded Truck Transpor $1.2700 $0.0181 | $0.0800 | $0.0015 | NoBid | (%0.0019) $0.0407 | ($0.0015)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
'd farade Ln'eacied Truck Transport A $1.2800 $0.0175 | $0.0800 | $0.0015 | No Bid No Bid $0.0407 | ($0.0015)
DELIVERY, ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 5 -
FEMmILm HTeacec IUCK TTenspor $1.2900 ($0.0303) | $0.0800 | ($0.0025) | NoBid | ($0.0350) $0.0407 | ($0.0207)
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Truck T t AUTOMATIC
remitim Lieaced TTLCK TTansport a4 $1.3000 ($0.0309) | $0.0800 | ($0.0025) | No Bid No Bid $0.0407 | ($0.0102)
DELIVERY, ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t WILL CALL, ZONE 5 - Net Pri
> Jruciciranspor etrrice No Bid $0.0702 NoBid | $1.5000 | NoBid | $0.0100 $0.5000 | $0.0275
Differential per Gallon
E85 Truck T t AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 5 Net
> Jruciciranspor 1 NoBid $0.0706 NoBid | $1.4999 | No Bid No Bid $0.5000 | $0.0275
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION THREE - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 1 - METROPOLITAN VIRGINIA
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 1 Net _ ,
eguliar Vieaded fank agon € $0.1587 $0.1774 | $0.0800 | $0.1828 | $0.2315 No Bid No Bid $0.1351
Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, _ _ ,
egtliar nieaded fank Tiagon $0.2487 $0.1773 | $0.0800 | $0.1828 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1351
ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 1 - _ , _
16 srade Lnieaded fank Tragon $0.0786 $0.1760 | $0.0800 | $0.1723 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $0.1049

Net Price Differential per Gallon
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Montgomery County, MD
IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)
Final Net Price Differentials
Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River Qil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Oil Companies
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank W AUTOMATIC
'd rade Un'eaded Tank Yagoh AU $0.1470 $0.1743 | $0.0800 | $0.1723 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1326
DELIVERY, ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 1 Net
remium Ynieaded fank Tagon 1 $0.1387 $0.1531 | $0.0800 | $0.1635 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1111
Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,
remium Ynieaded Tank Tagon $0.1687 $0.1541 | $0.0800 | $0.1635 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1111
ZONE 1 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 1 - Net Pri
°> ank ivagon etrrice No Bid $0.2193 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1760
Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 1 Net . . . . .
ank t¥agon © No Bid $0.2181 NoBid | $1.5000 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $0.1760

Price Differential per Gallon

SECTION THREE - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 2 - MONTGOMERY COUNTY, MARYLAND

Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 2 Net

guiar _ $0.3870 $0.1401 | $0.0800 | $0.1204 | $0.1808 No Bid No Bid $0.0978
Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,

esuiar nieaded fank ¥agon $0.4870 $0.1394 | $0.0800 | $0.1204 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $0.0978
ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 2 -

\d Srade Unjeaded Tank Tiagon $0.0787 $0.1388 | $0.0800 | $0.1125 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0798
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC

10 rade Lnieaded fank Tagon AL $0.1287 $0.1384 | $0.0800 | $0.1125 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0798
DELIVERY, ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 2 Net

remium Ynieaded fank Tagon 1 $0.0974 $0.1549 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1129
Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,

remitim Lnieaded Tank ¥¥agon $0.1387 $0.1547 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1129
ZONE 2 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 2 - Net Pri

>> fank ivagon etrrice No Bid $0.1809 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1387
Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 2 Net

ank YWagon € No Bid $0.1810 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1387

Price Differential per Gallon
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Montgomery County, MD

IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)
Final Net Price Differentials
Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River Qil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Oil Companies
SECTION THREE - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 3 - PRINCE GEORGE'S COUNTY, MARYLAND
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 3 Net _ ,
eguiar nieaded fank tagon © $0.1487 $0.1239 | $0.0800 | $0.1192 | $0.1597 No Bid No Bid $0.0816
Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, _ _ ,
eguiar Unieaded fank Tagon $0.2270 $0.1232 | $0.0800 | $0.1192 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0816
ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 3 - _ _ ,
\c brade Unieaded fank Tagon $0.1987 $0.1126 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC
'd rade Un'eaded Tank Yagoh AU $0.2487 $0.1222 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
DELIVERY, ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 3 Net
remium Lnieaded Tank Wagon 1 s0.1987 $0.1009 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
Price Differential per Gallon
Premium Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,
rermitiin Lieaued Tank sagon $0.2570 $0.1007 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
ZONE 3 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 3 - Net Pri
>> Tank ¥¥agon etrrice No Bid $0.1641 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1225
Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 3 Net
= 1ank tragon € No Bid $0.1660 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1225
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION THREE - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 4 - WASHINGTON, DC
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 4 Net _ _ _
eguiar nieaded fanik Wagon € $0.0757 $0.1218 | $0.0800 | $0.1359 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
Price Differential per Gallon
Regular Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, _ _ ,
eguiar Unieaded fank Tagon $0.1470 $0.1224 | $0.0800 | $0.1359 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon WILL CALL, ZONE 4 - _ _ ,
'c brade Unjeaded fank Tagon $0.0787 $0.1203 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank Wagon AUTOMATIC
16 brade Unieaded fank Tragon AV $0.1770 $0.1200 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0795
DELIVERY, ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
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Montgomery County, MD

IFB #1027354
Online Bidding for Cooperative
Purchase of Unleaded Gasoline and E85 (Reverse Auction)
Final Net Price Differentials
Opening Date: June 2, 2014

Hightowers | James | Mansfield Petroleum Southern Truman
Fannon . . PAPCO
Petroleum River oil Traders MD Arnold
Petroleum ) Inc ) . )
Co. Solutions | Company Corporation Oil Companies
P i Unleaded Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 4 Net
remium Un'eaded Tank Wagon 1 $0.0696 $0.0989 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0557
Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,
remiuim Lnieaded Tank Wagon $0.1770 $0.0991 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.0557
ZONE 4 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 4 - Net Pri
>> 1ank fiagon etrrice No Bid $0.1641 | $0.0800 | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1206
Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 4 Net
> 1ank ivagon ¢ No Bid $0.1627 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1206
Price Differential per Gallon
SECTION THREE - TANK WAGON DELIVERY - ZONE 5 - ANNE ARUNDEL COUNTY, MARYLAND
R lar Unleaded Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 5 Net
eular “nieaded fani wagon | s0.0567 $0.0970 | $0.0800 | $0.1352 | NoBid No Bid $0.0936 | $0.0547
Price Differential per Gallon
R lar Unleaded Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,
esuiar Unieaded fani vagon $0.4870 $0.0968 | $0.0800 | $0.1352 | No Bid No Bid $0.0936 | $0.0547
ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Unleaded Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 5 -
@ Brade Leaged Tank Tagon $0.4870 $0.0920 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid $0.0936 | $0.0488
Net Price Differential per Gallon
Mid Grade Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 5 -
sieaiailite:anh $0.4870 $0.0911 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid $0.0936 | $0.0488
Net Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 5 Net
remium Lnieaded Tank Wagon 1 s0.4870 $0.0446 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid $0.1200 | $0.0014
Price Differential per Gallon
P i Unleaded Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY,
remium Ynieaded fank Tragon $0.4870 $0.0432 | $0.0800 | $0.1935 | No Bid No Bid $4.0000 | $0.0014
ZONE 5 - Net Price Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank W WILL CALL, ZONE 5 - Net Pri
>> tank fiagon etrrice No Bid $0.1391 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid $4.0000 | $0.0965
Differential per Gallon
E85 Tank W AUTOMATIC DELIVERY, ZONE 5 Net
an wagon ¢ No Bid $0.1390 NoBid | $1.5000 | No Bid No Bid $4.0000 | $0.0965

Price Differential per Gallon
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